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I read the recent report by Asgari et ai. (1)
with a great interest. They studied on the
seroprevalence of T gondii in chicken and
concluded that "B-ased on cultural and food
habits in our area, the meat and viscera of
chicken may be important sources of infec-
tion in human when consuming semi-cooked
meats" and also mentioned for several
means to control of the transmittable T
gondii from chicken. There are some con-
cerns on this report. Indeed, the T gondii as
a food borne disease is recently proposed
and chicken were proposed as important
sources of infection in many countries (2 -
3). Dubey recently reported that very high
prevalence of the parasite could be found in
chickens raised in backyards and free-range
organic establishments [2]. In the report by
Asgari et aI., the in depth analysis for these
backgrounds might give more useful
information. In addition, although the
suggestions by them are useful not all arise
from their seroprevalence study. There is no
complete assessment on the human
seroprevalence in that area as well as the
chicken eating behavior of those people. It
should also be noted that statistically signifi-
cant correlation of T gondii infection was
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found with cat, chicken and pig contact but
none with consumption of meat, milk, and
eggs (4).
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Many thanks for constructive aforemen-
tioned comments, which have been made by
Dr Wiwanitkit about our recently published
article.
In the introduction of our paper, we stated
that the disease occurs mostly through inges-
tion of undercooked meat or by the oocysts
excreted by infected cats (1). Infected chick-
ens are considered as an important source of
T gondii infection worldwide (2). Since the
oocyst excreted by cats is usually ingested
by chicken due to their feeding habits of
chicken, the rate of toxoplasmosis in free-
ranging chickens is one of the suitable
indicators of environmental contamination
and infested backyard cats (3).
Human seropositivity was reported 51.8% in
Iran with a 55% and 29% seroprevalence in
northern and southern parts of the country,
respectively (4-6). The ovine, caprine, bo-
vine, and chicken liver are consumed by
people in Iran. As pointed out in this issue,
liver is usually consumed undercooked even
raw in past. Consequently, no evaluation be-
tween prevalence of disease and this food
habit has been undergone.
In a recent study, we have detected
Toxoplasma in 12 out of 31 livers of infested
sheep and goats by PCR methods (7). Since
the cooking of the liver requires low

temperature, the infectivity of liver is more
important than the meat. On the other hand,
the viscera and inedible of livestock were
fed by yard cats and the life cycle of parasite
is completed.
Risk of T gondii infection in humans mostly
derives from exposure to the feces of a cat
that is shedding oocysts and consumption of
contaminated meat (8). The disease is not
transmitted merely by chicken and pig con-
tact, which has pointed out Dr Wiwanitkit.
The consumption of pork is prohibited in the
Muslim religion and this is not a risk factor
for transmission of Toxoplasma in Muslim
country.
Finally, although the viable T gondii were
found in colostrums and milk, these findings
have not been confirmed yet and it seems
likely that the outbreaks might be due to
other causes. Moreover, the prevalence of T
gondii in chicken eggs is extremely low and
the ingestion of uncooked eggs is not consid-
ered an important risk for toxoplasmosis (9).

Sincerely
Asgari Q

Corresponding Author: TeVFax: +98-711-2305291,
E-mail: asgarig@sums.ac.ir

References:
1. Dubey JP. Advances in the life cycle of

Toxoplasma gondii. Inter J Parasitol.
1998;28:1019-1024.

2. Tenter AM, Heckeroth AR Weiss LM.
Toxoplasma gondii: From animal to hu-
man. InterJ Parasitol.2000;30:1217-58.

3. Devada K, Anandan R, Dubey JP. Sero-
logicprevalenceof Toxoplasma gondii in
chickensin Madras. Ind J Parasitol.1998;
84:621-622.

4. GhorbaniM, EdrissianGH, AssadN. Se-
rological survey of toxoplasmosis in the
northern part of Iran, using indirect
fluorescentantibody technique. Trans R
SacTropMedHyg. 1978;72(4):369-71.

mailto:asgarig@sums.ac.ir

