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ABSTRACT

Background: Surgical stress response to an 
involuntary response to tissue damage and changes 
in the form of autonomic, hormonal and metabolic 
appears And fluctuations in blood sugar leads. The 
purpose of this study was to evaluate the effects of 
spinal anesthesia and sedation in patients undergoing 
surgical abortion is blood sugar fluctuations.

Materials and methods: In this cross-sectional 
study, 50 patients admitted for elective abortion, 
including the method selected and assigned to two 
groups of 25 sedation and spinal anesthesia were 
divided. In both groups, blood sugar 10 minutes 
before making the animals unconscious minutes, 20 
and 60 min after induction were evaluated. Data 
Analysis with SPSS software, version 19 with t-test 
and chi-square tests. 

Results: The levels of blood sugar, 10 minutes 
before the start of anesthesia in sedation groups 
89.96 ±13.32 and in the spinal anesthesia group 
88.60±16.98, which was not significantly 
different(p=0.706). The levels of blood sugar, 20 
min after induction in sedation group  80.88±13.13 
and spinal anesthesia group 85.88± 15.05, which 
was not significantly different(p=0.268). 60 min 
after induction, the blood sugar in sedation group 
83.24±15.78 and in the spinal anesthesia group 
90.04±16.26, which did not show a significant 
difference(p=0.140).  

Conclusion: The change of glucose in response to 
the stress of surgery under spinal anesthesia and 
Sedation in both groups had the same type of 
anesthesia had no significant effect on blood 
glucose. 

Keywords: Blood sugar, sedation, spinal, curettage 
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after induction, the blood sugar in sedation group 
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90.04±16.26, which did not show a significant 
difference(p=0.140).  
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